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eProcurement

Tender Details

s

System

Date : 23-Dec-2025 04:12 PM

& Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain

Department of Agricultural Research and Education||Indian Council of Agricultural Research,DoARE,MoA| |IIVR-
Varansi-ICAR-DoARE

Tender Reference
Number

3-665/2025/ADM.I

Tender ID 2025_DARE_891127_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical N ItemWise Technical Evaluation N
Evaluation Allowed ° Allowed °
Payment Mode Offline Is Multi Currency Allowed For ™

BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Offlines.No [Instrument Type Cover No |Cover Document Type Description
1 Demand Draft ) TENDER
3 < 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical |.pdf DOCUMENTS
3 Bank Guarantee 2 Finance Xls PRICE BID
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ (10,500 |EMD Exemption Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At (Nil Allowed
Tender Fee No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
Exemption Allowed EMD Payable To ICAR EMD Payable At VARANASI
UNIT,
IIVR,
VARANASI
Click to view modification history
Work /Item(s),
Title Signage board for main campus at ICAR-IIVR Varanasi. U.P.
Work Description Signage board for main campus at ICAR-IIVR Varanasi. U.P.
Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents.
Details
Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in  |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in ¥ 5,22,914 Product Category Civil Works - Sub category NA
Others
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work(Days) [NA
Location ICAR- IIVR, Pincode 221305 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
VARANASI
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date  [NA Bid Opening Place ICAR-IIVR,
Address VARANASI
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder
Critical Dates
Publish Date 23-Dec-2025 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 08-Jan-2026 10:00 AM
Document Download / Sale Start 23-Dec-2025 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM
Date Date
Clarification Start Date 23-Dec-2025 05:00 PM Clarification End Date 06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM




!Bid Submission Start Date

23-Dec-2025 05:00 PM

%Bid Submission End Date

06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT N
Document S.No Document Name Description :)igcil(lg;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 480.63
Work Item
Documents |/S.No/ Document Type Document Name Description g;:u(';:‘eEtB)
1 BOQ BOQ_936652.xls Price Bid 332.50
2 Tender Documents TECHNICALBIDDOCUMENTVEHICLESHEDATIIVR.pdfiTENDER DOCUMENTS 733,15

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1, ao.icariivr@gmail.com Balvir Singh Balvir Singh

2. opi.nath@icar.org.in Gopi Nath Gopi Nath

3. sudeep.singh@icar.org.in SUDEEP SINGH Sudeep Singh

4, rai.rajesh72@gmail.com RAJESH RAIL Rajesh Kumar Rai

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering Process |No Show Technical bid status Yes

allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Technical Bid Opening
status Public Domain

BoQ Comparative Chart [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 2

model places

BoQ Comparative Chart L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

TIA Undertaking

Tender complying with Order

Reason for non compliance of Order

S.No |Undertaking to Order
1 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree
2 MSEs Order 2012 Agree

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

DIRECTOR ICAR-IIVR, VARANASI

Address

ICAR- IIVR, VARANASI

Tender Creator Details

Created By RAJESH RAI
Designation Assitant Administrative Officer
Created Date 23-Dec-2025 03:59 PM




Government eProcurement System Government of India
eProcurement Tender Details
S}\gstﬁ I Date : 22-Dec-2025 05:30 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
o isation Chai Department of Agricultural Research and Education||Indian Council of Agricultural Research,DoARE,MoA||IIVR-
rganisation Lhain Varansi-ICAR-DOARE
Tender Reference
NiithBer 3-665/2025-Adm.I
Tender ID 2025_DARE_890969_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical N ItemWise Technical Evaluation N
Evaluation Allowed g Allowed °
Payment Mode Offline Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ

Is Multi Currency o
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Offline s No [Instrument Type Cover No |Cover Document Type Description

1 Demand Draft ) Tender Bid

- e 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical |.pdf Prochments

3 Bank Guarantee 2 Finance Xls Price Bid
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ 9,000 |EMD Exemption Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At lNiI Allowed
Tender Fee No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
Exemption Allowed EMD Payable To ICAR EMD Payable At VARANASI

UNIT
IIVR
Click to view modification history
Work /Item(s)
Title Signage board at sunderbagia guest house, ICAR -IIVR Varanasi, U.P.
Work Description Signage board at sunderbagia guest house, ICAR -IIVR Varanasi, U.P.
Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents.
Details
Independent External [NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in ¥ 4,39,396 Product Category Civil Works - Sub category NA
; Others
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work(Days) |NA
Location ICAR-IIVR, Pincode 221305 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
VARANASI UP

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place ICAR-IIVR
Address VARANASI
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder
Critical Dates
Publish Date 23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM Bid Opening Date 08-Jan-2026 10:00 AM
Document Download / Sale Start 23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End 06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM
Date Date
Clarification Start Date 23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM Clarification End Date 06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM
Bid Submission Start Date 23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM Bid Submission End Date 06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM




Tender Documents

NIT -
Document | S.No Document Name Description ?i:‘:l;’;‘)e“t Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 481.10
Work Item .
Documents | S.No/Document Type Document Name Description g;:u(?:’eaa)
TENDER BID
1 Tender Documents TECHNICALBIDDOCUMENTVEHICLESHEDATIIVR.pdeOCUMENTS 733.17
2 BOQ BOQ_936486.xls PRICE BID 298.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. sudeep.singh@icar.org.in SUDEEP SINGH Sudeep Singh

2 satyam.shubham@icar.org.in Satyam Shubham Satyam Shubham
3. rai.rajesh72@gmail.com RAJESH RAI Rajesh Kumar Rai
4, ao.icariivr@gmail.com Balvir Singh Balvir Singh

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering Process [No Show Technical bid status Yes

allowed

Show Finance bid Yes |Stage to disclose Bid Details in Technical Bid Opening
status Public Domain

BoQ Comparative Chart [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 2

model places

BoQ Comparative Chart |L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

TIA Undertaking

S.No |Undertaking to Order ‘Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order
1 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree
2 MSEs Order 2012 Agree

Tender Inviting Authority
Name DIRECTOR ICAR-IIVR VNS
Address DIRECTOR ICAR-IIVR VARANASI UP 221305

Tender Creator Details

Created By RAJESH RAI

Designation Assitant Administrative Officer
Created Date 22-Dec-2025 05:19 PM




Government

eProcurement System Government of India

Tender Details

" eProcurement
' System

Date : 22-Dec-2025 05:07 PM

& Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain

Department of Agricultural Research and Education

Varansi-ICAR-DoARE

||Indian Council of Agricultural Research,DoARE,MoA||ITVR-

Tender Reference
Number

3-665/2025-Adm.I

Tender ID 2025_DARE_890952_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical N ItemWise Technical Evaluation N
Evaluation Allowed i Allowed 0
Payment Mode Offline Is Multi Currency Allowed For No

BOQ
Is Multi Currency _—_
Allowed Eor Fea No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Offlines,No [Instrument Type Cover No |Cover Document Type Description
1 Demand Draft : Technical Bid
5 — 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical |.pdf Documents
3 Bank Guarantee 2 Finance XIs BoQ

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details

Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amount in ¥ 14,000 [EMD Exemption Yes

Fee Payable To Fee Payable At [Nil Allowed

Tender Fee EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

Exemption Allowed EMD Payable To ICAR  |[EMD Payable At VARANASI

UNIT up
IIVR

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title

Wooden Tile flooring

Work Description

Wooden Tile Flooring (Wooden) at ICAR-IIVR, VARANASI, UP 221305.

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents.

Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in ¥ 7,13,380 Product Category Civil Sub category NA
Works -
Others
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work(Days) |NA
Location ICAR-INDIAN Pincode 221305 |Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
INSTITUTE OF
VEGETABLE RESEARCH,
VNS
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place ICAR-INDIAN
Address INSTITUTE OF
VEGETABLE
RESEARCH
Shouid Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

[23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM

Bid Opening Date

07-Jan-2026 10:00 AM




Document Download / Sale Start
Date

23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM
Date

Document Download / Sale End

05-Jan-2026 05:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM

Clarification End Date

05-Jan-2026 05:00 PM

Bid Submission Start Date

23-Dec-2025 10:00 AM

Bid Submission End Date

05-Jan-2026 05:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT -
Document S.No Document Name Description Z:C;Bn;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 480.59
Work Item
Documents | S-No|Document Type Document Name Description gioz:u(ril:‘e;;)
TECHNICAL BID
1 Tender Documents TECHNICALBIDDOCUMENTVEHICLESHEDATIIVR.pdfDOCUME'\ITS 733.38
2 BOQ BOQ_936476.xls PriceBid 293.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. ao.icariivr@gmail.com Balvir Singh Balvir Singh

2% sudeep.singh@icar.org.in SUDEEP SINGH Sudeep Singh

3. satyam.shubham@icar.org.in Satyam Shubham Satyam Shubham
4. rai.rajesh72@gmail.com RAJESH RAI Rajesh Kumar Rai

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering Process |No Show Technical bid status Yes

allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Technical Bid Opening
status Public Domain

BoQ Comparative Chart Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 2

imodel places

BoQ Comparative Chart |L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

TIA Undertaking

S.No |Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order
1 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree

2 MSEs Order 2012 Agree

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

DIRECTOR, ICAR-IIVR, VARANASI

Address

ICAR-IIVR, VARANASI, UP 221305.

Tender Creator Details

A e e e e ——————

Created By RAJESH RAI

Designation

Assitant Administrative Officer

Created Date

22-Dec-2025 04:55 PM




¢ Government

eProcurement System Government of India

Tender Details

"_eProcurement
‘ System

Date : 23-Dec-2025 03:42 PM

&) Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain

Department of Agricultural Research and Education

Varansi-ICAR-DoARE

[/Indian Council of Agricultural Research,DoARE,MoA| |IIVR-

Tender Reference
Number

3-665/2025/Adm.I

Tender ID 2025_DARE_891107_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical N ItemWise Technical Evaluation N
Evaluation Allowed ° Allowed °
Payment Mode Offline Is Multi Currency Allowed For No

BOQ
Is Multi Currency .
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Offlin ES.No Instrument Type Cover No |Cover Document Type Description

1 Demand Draft ) Tender

5 i 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical |.pdf Documents

3 Bank Guarantee 2 Finance Xls Price bid
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amount in ¥ 17,000 |EMD Exemption Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At [Nl Allowed
Tender Fee No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
Exemption Allowed EMD Payable To ICAR-  |[EMD Payable At VARANASI

UNIT,
IIVR
Click to view modification history
Work /Item(s)
Title Renovation of Gene Bank at ICAR -IIVR Varanasi U.P.
Work Description Rerovation of Gene Bank at ICAR -IIVR Varerasi. U.P.
Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents.
Details
Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in ¥ 8,58,59,598 Product Category Civil Works - Sub category NA
Others
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work(Days) |NA
Location ICAR-IIVR, Pincode 221305 Pre Bid Meeting Place [NA
VARANASI

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place ICAR-TIVR,
Address VARANASI
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder
Critical Dates
Publish Date 23-Dec-2025 04:00 PM Bid Opening Date 08-Jan-2026 10:00 AM
Document Dewnload / Sale Start 23-Dec-2025 04:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM
Date ‘ Date
gﬂifigggpn Start Date 23-Dec-2025 04:00 PM Clarification End Date 06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM

| Bid Sl{‘l‘ay_qifsion Start Date

23-Dec-2025 04:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

06-Jan-2026 05:00 PM

| UGN




Tender Documents

NIT A
Document | S.No| Document Name Description ng;B“;e“t Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 481.17
Work Item
Documents ||S.No/Document Type Document Name Description git;t;u(l;:‘e:;)
1 ‘Tender Documents TECHNICALBIDDOCUMENTVEHICLESHEDATIIVR.pdfiTENDER DOCUMENTS 733.16
2 BOQ BOQ_936626.xls BOQ 336.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name
1. ao.icariivr@gmail.com Balvir Singh Balvir Singh

2. sudeep.singh@icar.org.in SUDEEP SINGH Sudeep Singh

3. satyam.shubham@icar.org.in Satyam Shubham Satyam Shubham
4, rai.rajesh72@gmail.com RAJESH RAIL Rajesh Kumar Rai

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering Process |No

Show Technical bid status

allowed
Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Technical Bid Opening
status Public Domain

BoQ Comparative Chart |Normal
model

BoQ Compartive chart decimal
laces

BoQ Comparative Chart L
Rank Type

Form Based BoQ

TIA Undertaking

S.No |Undertaking to Order

Tender complying with Order

Reason for non compliance of Order

1 PPP-MII Order 2017

Agree

2 MSEs Order 2012

Agree

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

DIRECTOR, ICAR-IIVR, VARANASI

Address

ICAR-IIVR, JAKHINI, VARANASI, UP.

Tender Creator Details

Created By

RAJESH RAI

Designation

Assitant Administrative Officer

Created Date

23-Dec-2025 03:06 PM




